
Item 
No. Size Description Qty  Unit Price Extension Manufacturer Model  Unit Price Extension Manufacturer Model

1.01 5/8" x 5/8" No Moving Parts, Electromagnetic/Ultrasonic Meter 200 158.00$         $   31,600.00 Master Meter
5/8" x 1/2" Polymer 
Sonata w/5' bare 
wire

165.00$         $   33,000.00 Sensus IPERL

1.02 5/8" x 3/4" No Moving Parts, Electromagnetic/Ultrasonic Meter 200 158.00$         $   31,600.00 Master Meter
5/8" x 3/4" Polymer 
Sonata w/5' bare 
wire

165.00$         $   33,000.00 Sensus IPERL

1.03 3/4" x 3/4" No Moving Parts, Electromagnetic/Ultrasonic Meter 400 170.00$         $   68,000.00 Master Meter

3/4" x 7 1/2" (3/4" 
short) Polymer 
Sonata w/5' bare 
wire

165.00$         $   66,000.00 Sensus IPERL

1.04 1" x 1" No Moving Parts, Electromagnetic/Ultrasonic Meter 600 235.00$         $ 141,000.00 Master Meter 1" Polymer Sonata 
w/5' bare wire 255.00$         $ 153,000.00 Sensus IPERL

2.01 1.5" x 1.5" Compound Meter, single register, floating ball or ultrasonic 40 1,668.00$      $   66,720.00 Master Meter
1 1/2" x 13" Octave 
SS Flating Flange 
w/9' bare wire

1,640.00$      $   65,600.00 Sensus OMNI

2.02 2" x 2" Compound Meter, single register, floating ball or ultrasonic 60 1,740.00$      $ 104,400.00 Master Meter

2" x 17", 2" x 13", 2" 
x 15 1/4" Octave SS 
Floating Flange w/9' 
bare wire

1,875.00$      $ 112,500.00 Sensus OMNI

2.03 3" x 3" Compound Meter, single register, floating ball or ultrasonic 10 2,942.71$      $   29,427.10 Master Meter

3" x 12" Octave SS 
Floating Flange 
w/Spool w/9' bare 
wire

2,344.00$      $   23,440.00 Sensus OMNI

2.04 4" x 4" Compound Meter, single register, floating ball or ultrasonic 10 4,636.37$      $   46,363.73 Master Meter

4" x 14" Octave SS 
Floating Flange 
w/spool w/9' bare 
wire

4,000.00$      $   40,000.00 Sensus OMNI

2.05 6" x 6" Compound Meter, single register, floating ball or ultrasonic 4 7,278.27$      $   29,113.07 Master Meter

6" x 18" Octave SS 
Floating Flange 
w/spool w9' bare 
wire

6,810.00$      $   27,240.00 Sensus OMNI

Ferguson Core & Main



2.06 8" x 8" Compound Meter, single register, floating ball or ultrasonic 2 9,879.68$      $   19,759.36 Master Meter

8" x 20" Octave SS 
Floating Flange 
w/spool w9' bare 
wire

12,010.00$    $   24,020.00 Sensus OMNI

2.07 10" x 10" Compound Meter, single register, floating ball or ultrasonic 2 12,171.99$    $   24,343.98 Master Meter
10" x 18" Octave 
Epoxy W/Spool 
w/91 bare wire

15,500.00$    $   31,000.00 Sensus OMNI

3.01 1.5" x 1.5" Turbo Meter 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,125.00$      $   28,125.00 Sensus OMNI
3.02 2" x 2" Turbo Meter 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,315.00$      $   32,875.00 Sensus OMNI
3.03 3" x 3" Turbo Meter 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,615.00$      $     8,075.00 Sensus OMNI
3.04 4" x 4" Turbo Meter 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,035.00$      $   15,175.00 Sensus OMNI
3.05 6" x 6" Turbo Meter 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5,400.00$      $   21,600.00 Sensus OMNI
3.06 8" x 8" Turbo Meter 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9,950.00$      $   19,900.00 Sensus OMNI
3.07 10" x 10" Turbo Meter 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12,935.00$    $   25,870.00 Sensus OMNI

4.01 1.5 x 1.5 Fire Meter 10 1,668.00$      $   16,680.00 Master Meter
1 1/2" x 13" octave 
SS Floating Flange 
w/9' bare wire

1,985.00$      $   19,850.00 Sensus Cordonel

4.02 2" x 2" Fire Meter 16 1,740.00$      $   27,840.00 Master Meter

2" x 17", 2" x 13", 2" 
x 15 1/4" Octave SS 
Floating Flange w/9' 
bare wire

2,140.00$      $   34,240.00 Sensus Cordonel

4.03 3" x 3" Fire Meter 12 2,667.00$      $   32,004.00 Master Meter
3" x 12" Octave SS 
Floating Flange w/9' 
bare wire

2,950.00$      $   35,400.00 Sensus Cordonel

4.04 4" x 4" Fire Meter, floating ball/ultrasonic 10 4,715.77$      $   47,157.73 Master Meter

4" x 14" Octave SS 
Floating Flange 
w/spool w/9' bare 
wire

7,950.00$      $   79,500.00 Sensus Cordonel

4.05 4" x 4" Fire Meter, single register, Turbo 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5,000.00$      $   50,000.00 Sensus Cordonel

4.06 6" x 6" Fire Meter, floating ball/ultrasonic 4 7,473.04$      $   29,892.16 Master Meter

6" x 18" Octave SS 
Floating Flange 
w/spool w9' bare 
wire

10,935.00$    $   43,740.00 Sensus OMNI

4.07 6" x 6" Fire Meter, single register, Turbo 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7,100.00$      $   28,400.00 Sensus Cordonel



4.08 8" x 8" Fire Meter, floating ball/ultrasonic 2 10,167.73$    $   20,335.46 Master Meter

8" x 20" Octave SS 
Floating Flange 
w/spool w/9' bare 
wire

17,500.00$    $   35,000.00 Sensus OMNI

4.09 8" x 8" Fire Meter, single register, Turbo 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.1 10" x 10" Fire Meter, floating ball/ultrasonic 2 12,977.97$    $   25,955.94 Master Meter
10" x 18" Octave 
Epoxy w/Spool w/9' 
bare wire

23,350.00$    $   46,700.00 Sensus OMNI

4.11 10" x 10" Fire Meter, single register, Turbo 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.01 5/8" x 5/8" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Composite Body 200 158.00$         $   31,600.00 Master Meter
5/8" x 1/2" Polymer 
Sonata w/5' bare 
wire

N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.02 5/8" x 5/8" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Metallic Body 200 205.00$         $   41,000.00 Master Meter
5/8" x 1/2" Brass 
Sonata w/5' bare 
wire

N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.03 5/8" x 3/4" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Composite Body 200 158.00$         $   31,600.00 Master Meter
5/8" x 3/4" Polymer 
Sonata w/5' bare 
wire

N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.04 5/8" x 3/4" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Metallic Body 200 205.00$         $   41,000.00 Master Meter
5/8" x 3/4" Brass 
Sonata w/5' bare 
wire

N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.05 3/4" x 3/4" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Composite Body 400 170.00$         $   68,000.00 Master Meter

3/4" x 7 1/2" (3/4" 
short) Polymer 
Sonata w/5' bare 
wire

N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.06 3/4" x 3/4" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Metallic Body 400 225.00$         $   90,000.00 Master Meter
3/4" x 7 1/2" (3/4" 
short) Brass Sonata 
w/5' bare wire

N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.07 1" x 1" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Composite Body 600 235.00$         $ 141,000.00 Master Meter 1" Polymer Sonata 
w/5' bare wire N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.08 1" x 1" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Metallic Body 600 310.00$         $ 186,000.00 Master Meter 1" Brass Sonata w/5' 
bare wire N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.09 1.5" x 1.5" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Composite Body 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,985.00$      $   79,400.00 Sensus Cordonel

5.1 1.5" x 1.5" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Stainless Body 40 1,668.00$      $   66,720.00 Master Meter
1 1/2" x 13 Octave 
SS Floating Flange 
w/9' bare wire

N/A N/A N/A N/A



5.11 1.5" x 1.5" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Bronze Body 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A
5.12 1.5" x 1.5" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Ductile Iron Body 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.13 2" x 2" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Composite Body 60 1,098.72$      $   65,923.20 Master Meter

2" x 17" Octave 
Polymer Floating 
Flange w/9' bare 
wire

2,140.00$      $ 128,400.00 Sensus Cordonel

5.14 2" x 2" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Stainless Body 60 1,740.00$      $ 104,400.00 Master Meter

2" x 17", 2" x 13", 2" 
x 15 1/4" Octave SS 
Floating Flange w/9' 
bare wire

N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.15 2" x 2" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Bronze Body 60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A
5.16 2" x 2" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Ductile Iron Body 60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.17 3" x 3" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Stainless Body 10 2,667.00$      $   26,670.00 Master Meter

3" x 12" Octave SS 
Floating Blange 
w/Spool w/9' bare 
wire

2,950.00$      $   29,500.00 Sensus

5.18 3" x 3" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Ductile Iron Body 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.19 4" x 4" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Stainless Body 10 4,278.00$      $   42,780.00 Master Meter

4" x 14" Octave SS 
Floating Flange 
w/spool w/9' bare 
wire

5,000.00$      $   50,000.00 Sensus Cordonel

5.2 4" x 4" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Ductile Iron Body 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.21 6" x 6" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Stainless Body 4 6,888.00$      $   27,552.00 Master Meter

6" x 18" Octave SS 
Floating Flange 
w/spool w9' bare 
wire

N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.22 6" x 6" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Ductile Iron Body 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.23 8" x 8" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Stainless Body 2 9,390.00$      $   18,780.00 Master Meter

8" x 20" Octave SS 
Floating Flange 
w/spool w/9' bare 
wire

N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.24 8" x 8" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Ductile Iron Body 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A

5.25 10" x 10" No Moving Parts, Ultrasonic Meter, Ductile Iron Body 2 13,660.37$    $   27,320.74 Master Meter
10" x 18" Octave 
Epoxy W/Spool 
w/91 bare wire

N/A N/A N/A N/A

6.01 2.5" x 2.5" Hydrant Meter, floating ball or ultrasonic w/ connections 
and BFP 4 2,154.00$      $     8,616.00 Master Meter 3" FHM USG CPL 

w/Check Valve 2,400.00$      $     9,600.00 Sensus OMNI



7.01 5/8" x 5/8" meter cplg-FORD C38-11-2-375-NL or equal - each 100 6.36$              $         636.47 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Couplers 16.00$            $     1,600.00 Ford Meter Box C38-11-2-275-NL

7.02 5/8" x 3/4" meter cplg-FORD C38-23-2-5-NL or equal - each 100 8.71$              $         870.59 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Couplers 17.50$            $     1,750.00 Ford Meter Box C35-23-2-5-NL

7.03 3/4" x 3/4" meter cplg-FORD C38-23-2-5-NL or equal - each 100 8.71$              $         870.59 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Couplers 17.50$            $     1,750.00 Ford Meter Box C38-23-2-5-NL

7.04 1" x 1" meter cplg-FORD C38-44-2-625-NL or equal - each 100 11.76$            $     1,176.47 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Couplers 27.00$            $     2,700.00 Ford Meter Box C38-44-2-625-NL

8.01 1.5" x 1.5" Bronze companion flanges (2), SS bolts/Nuts 40 79.60$            $     3,184.00 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Flanges 120.00$         $     4,800.00 Midland  

8.02 2" x 2" Bronze companion flanges (2), SS bolts/Nuts 60 85.13$            $     5,107.76 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Flanges 135.01$         $     8,100.60 Midland  

8.03 3" x 3" Bronze companion flanges (2), SS bolts/Nuts 10 258.82$         $     2,588.24 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Flanges 605.00$         $     6,050.00 Midland  

8.04 4" x 4" Bronze companion flanges (2), SS bolts/Nuts 10 370.59$         $     3,705.88 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Flanges 925.00$         $     9,250.00 Midland  

8.05 6" x 6" Bronze companion flanges (2), SS bolts/Nuts 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 935.00$         $     3,740.00 Midland  
8.06 8" x 8" Bronze companion flanges (2), SS bolts/Nuts 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,450.00$      $     2,900.00 Midland  
8.07 10" x 10" Bronze companion flanges (2), SS bolts/Nuts 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4,140.00$      $     8,280.00 Midland  

9.01 5/8" x 5/8" gaskets each 500 0.08$              $           41.18 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Gaskets 0.20$              $         100.00 Lansdale

9.02 5/8" x 3/4" gaskets each 500 0.08$              $           41.18 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Gaskets 0.20$              $         100.00 Lansdale

9.03 3/4" x 3/4" gaskets each 1000 0.08$              $           82.35 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Gaskets 0.20$              $         200.00 Lansdale

9.04 1" x 1" gaskets each 1500 0.09$              $         141.18 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Gaskets 0.30$              $         450.00 Lansdale

9.05 1.5" x 1.5" gaskets each 100 0.92$              $           91.76 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Gaskets 1.25$              $         125.00 Lansdale

9.06 2" x 2" gaskets each 150 1.07$              $         160.59 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Gaskets 2.00$              $         300.00 Lansdale

9.07 3" x 3" gaskets each 30 2.28$              $           68.47 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Gaskets 4.00$              $         120.00 Lansdale

9.08 4" x 4" gaskets each 30 3.31$              $           99.18 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Gaskets 4.00$              $         120.00 Lansdale

9.09 6" x 6" gaskets each 10 5.04$              $           50.35 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Gaskets 5.00$              $           50.00 Lansdale



9.1 8" x 8" gaskets each 10 7.22$              $           72.24 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Gaskets 8.00$              $           80.00 Lansdale

9.11 10" x 10" gaskets each 10 10.65$            $         106.47 ProSelect ProSelect Meter 
Gaskets 10.00$            $         100.00 Lansdale

10 each touchpad -wall mounted 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 25.00$            $   25,000.00 Sensus IPERL

10 each MXU -touchpad mounted 2000 190.00$         $ 380,000.00 Master Meter Allegro Wall Unit 180.00$         $ 360,000.00 Sensus 510M Smartpoint

10 each MXU for touch coupler, pit lid mounted 50 190.00$         $     9,500.00 Master Meter Allegro Pit Unit 185.00$         $     9,250.00 Sensus 520M Smartpoint

10 each MXU dual port Hard Wire touchpad mount 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 255.00$         $   12,750.00 Sensus 510M M2 
Smartpoint

10.1 each MXU dual port pit lid mounted 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 265.00$         $   13,250.00 Sensus 520M M2 
Smartpoint

10.1 1000' reel Cable - 18 gage - 3 wire 10 250.00$         $     2,500.00 Master Meter Cable 18 Gage 3 
Wire 275.00$         $     2,750.00 Sensus

10.1 box of 100 gel caps -3M Scotchlok or equal 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.20$              $             4.00 Sensus UY2

10.1 each hand held touchpad reader - pocket style 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 625.00$         $     1,250.00 Sensus M3096+

10.1 each Smart Gun w/ telescopic Wand 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,300.00$      $     6,600.00 Sensus AG6590

10.10 each Vehicle transceiver unit w/ antenna and cabling 1 4,687.00$      $     4,687.00 Master Meter Allegro 2WMMR 
Radio Receiver 22,000.00$    $   22,000.00 Sensus 4700 VGB MAS1


