East Windsor MUA
Roadway Material Bid Price Sheet 2026-2027

Bid Opening: January 9, 2026 10:00 am

Britton Industries

Green Dream

Hermans Trucking

Stavola

The Yaros

Trap Rock

Walter R. Earle -

Inc. International LLC Inc. Construction Company Inc. Industries LLC Burlington Inc.
Materials LLC
Section A: Broken Stone - Delivered
Item No. Description Unit Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
A-1 #57 (3/4") Clean Stone Tons | $ 30.95 | $ 42.60 | S 35.50 S 33.70 | § 35.20 | § 34.50 No Bid
A-2 #8 (3/8") Clean Stone Tons | $ 54.95 [ $ 60.60 | $ 64.50 S 59.70 | $ 62.50 | $ 60.75 No Bid
A-3 #5 (1") Stone Tons No Bid S 50.16 | $ 40.25 Al S 33.70 | § 62.50 | $ 34.50 No Bid
A-4 #1 (3 12”) Stone Tons No Bid S 43.80 | $ 40.25 B No Bid S 62.50 | $ 38.25 No Bid
A-5 #2 (2 ¥2”) Stone Tons No Bid S 4392 1§ 40.25 C| S 33.70 | § 72.50 | $ 38.25 No Bid
A-6 #4 (1 2”) Stone Tons | $ 30.95 | $ 49.50 | $ 40.25 S 33.70 | § 72.50 | $ 38.25 No Bid
A7 3/4" QP (DGA) (Quarry Blend) Tons | $ 2495 | $ 37.80 | $ 29.25 S 29.50 | $ 3250 | $ 26.50 No Bid
A-8 Riprap stone 6” - 9” Tons No Bid S 48.00 | $ 52.00 D No Bid S 80.00 | $ 48.75 No Bid
Section B: Bituminous Materials - Picked up using EWMUA trucks
Item No. Description Unit | Distance in Miles | Distance in Miles | Distance in Miles Distance in Miles | Distance in Miles | Distance in Miles | Distance in Miles
N/A Driving distance from Bidder's location to EWMUA Miles 19.2 miles No Bid Quarry #1 9.9 9.1 miles 10 miles No Bid 20 miles
147 Millstone Rd, East Windsor, NJ 08512 miles
ONE-WAY Quarry #2 37.7
miles
N/A Driving distance from Bidder's location to EWMUA Miles 38.4 miles No Bid Quarry #1 21.1 18.2 miles 20 miles No Bid 40 miles
147 Millstone Rd, East Windsor, NJ 08512 miles
ROUND-TRIP Quarry #2 73.1
miles
Item No. Description Unit Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
B-1 EZ Street High Performance Cold Mix 3/8 in Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 155.00
B-2 EZ Street High Performance Cold Mix % in Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid S 160.00 No Bid No Bid S 155.00
Section C: Sand - Delivered
Item No. Description Unit Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
C-1 Unwashed Sand Fill Tons No Bid S 31.60 | $ 21.75 E No Bid S 50.00 No Bid No Bid
c-2 Washed Coarse Sand Tons No Bid S 37.60 | $ 29.25 F No Bid S 50.00 No Bid No Bid
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Hermans Trucking bid #4 stone
Hermans Trucking bid #3 stone
Hermans Trucking bid #3 stone
Hermans Trucking bid small core stone
Hermans Trucking bid fill sand
Hermans Trucking bid C-33 sand




