
Item Quantity Description  Price per Each Extended Price  Price per Each Extended Price  Price per Each Extended Price
1.01 500 linear feet 24" pipe (*) 113.15$                  56,575.00$             8,490.43$               42,452.15$             A No Bid No Bid
1.02 350 linear feet 30" pipe (**) 185.39$                  64,886.50$             13,318.09$             46,613.32$             B No Bid No Bid
1.03 2 30" X 24" reducer DR11 DIPS (**) 3,304.12$               6,608.24$               2,109.01$               4,218.02$               No Bid No Bid
1.04 2 16" 4000 SDR 11 DIPS Flange Adapter (*) 274.36$                  548.72$                  265.69$                  531.38$                  No Bid No Bid
1.05 2 16" DIPS Back Up Ring (*) 256.84$                  513.68$                  188.76$                  377.52$                  No Bid No Bid
1.06 4 24" HDPE MJ Adaptor DR11 w/stiffner (*) 2,678.75$               10,715.00$             2,447.94$               9,791.76$               No Bid No Bid
2.01 2 16" X 10" Flanged 90 C110 USA (*) 4,765.00$               9,530.00$               4,816.01$               9,632.02$               4,619.44$               9,238.88$               
2.02 2 16" X 10" Flanged Long Radius 90 C110 USA (*) 6,730.00$               13,460.00$             6,801.28$               13,602.56$             6,523.68$               13,047.36$             
2.03 2 16" X 10" Flanged Reducer C110 USA (*) 1,715.00$               3,430.00$               1,731.92$               3,463.84$               1,661.23$               3,322.46$               
2.04 2 10" Blind Flange DI USA (*) 334.00$                  668.00$                  337.61$                  675.22$                  337.86$                  675.72$                  
3.01 1 16” full face gasket (*) 12.00$                     12.00$                     34.38$                     34.38$                     21.50$                     21.50$                     C
3.02 16 7/8” x 4” hex head bolts, nuts and washers (*) 8.00$                       128.00$                  7.00$                       112.00$                  10.50$                     168.00$                  

A Ferguson: Based on (5) 100 linear feet quantities, totaling 500 linear feet
B Ferguson: Based on (3.5) 100 linear feet quantities, totaling 350 linear feet
C Raritan bid 1/8" thickness
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